Paper, Plastics and Cleaning Products

Bid Date: 12/20/16
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1 Donahue Bros. Central Paper Shaheen Bros. Conlon Products Thurston Foods Central Poly Ekon-0O-Pac

LN

ITEM ESTQTY

M Q Pack
2 Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size |Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost Pack Size Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size |Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost |Pack Size |Unit Cost Unit Pack Cost Size
3
4 |1 |Bags Clear Food 12,500 $ .063 ea $63.93 pk 1000 $ .044ea $22.00 pk 500 $ .08ea $19.98 pk 1/250ct .0264 ea $26.40 pk 1000 $ .079ea $19.89 pk 250 ct $0.051ea  |$25.33 pk 500 $0.2064 ea $103.20 pk 500
5 |2 |Bags, Crystal Clear 100,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.02ea $100.00pk 5000
6 |3 |Bags. Sealing Tape 40 No Bid No Bid $2.67 ea $2.67 pk 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.70 ea $3.70 pk each
7 |4 |Bags, Paper, Brown 150,000 $ 013 ea $6.98 pk 500 $.01538 ea $7.69 pk 500 $ 013 ea $6.59 pk 500ct $ 01642 ea $8.21 pk 500 $ .004 ea $8.87 pk 2000ct  |NoBid No Bid

5 |Bowls, Soup, 80z, wiLids C$ .031ea C $31.97pk L 1000 $ .030 bowl ea $30.66 bowl pk
3 25,000 L $ 018ea $18.17 pk 1000 $ 04164 ea $41.64 pk 1000 $ 0473 ea $47.31 pk 1/1M No Bid $ 016lid ea  $16.67lid pk  1000ct  |No Bid No Bid

6 |Bowls, 10-12 oz. foam wilip C S .033ea L C $33.81pk L 1000 Lam $ .02235ea $22.35 pk 1000
9 50,000 $ .018ea $18.17 pk 1000 Non-Lam .01396ea $ 13.96 pk 1000 $ .0139ea $13.91 pk 1/1m No Bid $ .022ea $22.13 pk 1000 ct No Bid No Bid
10]7 |Box. Take-out chicken 125,000 $ .179ea $44.89 pk 250 $ 159 ea $39.75 pk 250 $ 16ea $64.65 pk 400ct $ .165ea $66.00 pk 400 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Cleaner, Disinfectant/Deodorizing
11 Spray 120 btl/cn No Bid $3.1875 ea $38.25 pk 12/20.0z $3.29ea $19.75 pk 6/320z $3.19 ea $38.28 pk 12/case 200zcan |$5.44 ea $32.64 pk 6/15.5z  |No Bid No Bid
12|9 |Cleaner, Glass 240 gts $2.21qt $13.29 pk 6/32 $1.896 gt $22.75 pk 12/32.02 |$1.93qt $11.55 pk 6/320z $1.79 gt $21.48 pk 12 $2.958 gt $17.75 pk 6/322 No Bid No Bid

10 Cleaner, Laundry Detergent
1319 | wibleach 2,000lbs | .7371b $25.80 pk 354 $ .781b $39.00 pk S04 $3.1721b $39.65 pk 80/2.502  |NoBid $2.16Ib $38.90 pk 2/1442  |NoBid No Bid
14|11 |Cleaner, Sponges wiscouring 800 $ 716ea $14.33 pk 20ct $.6125 ea $12.25 pk 20 $ 59ea $11.73 pk 1/20ct $ 55ea $11.00 pk 20 $ 422ea $16.89 pk 40ct No Bid No Bid
15|12 |Cleaner, Scouring Pads (green) |1 5q $ 289ea $5.79 pk 20ct $ 2485 ea $4.97 pk 20 $ 30ea $5.98 pk 1/20ct $ 191ea $11.46 pk 60 S 221ea ‘$13.26 ok 6/10ct  |NoBid No Bid

13 | Cups, Portion Control, 40z, wiLid C$ .013ea L C $34.71pk L C2500 cups$ .01352 ea cups $33.80 pk $ .0129cupea  $32.37 cup pk
16 250,000 $.009 ea $24.31 pk 12500 |$ .0241ea $60.25 pk 2500 $ 22ea $55.26 pk 2500ct lids $ .0091ea lids$22.75pk  2500/case 2500/case |$ .0092lid ea  $22.90 lid pk  20/125ct |No Bid No Bid
17|14 |Cups, S0z plastic 10,000 $ Ollea $29.07 pk 2500 s 0121ea $30.25 pk 2500 $ 01118ea  |$37.95 pk 2500ct $ .012256 ea ‘$30.64 pk ‘2500/case $ .010ea $26.52 pk 2500ct  |NoBid No Bid
18|15 |Cups, 70z plastic 5,000 $ 0l4ea $35.51 pk 2500 $ 014672 ea $36.68 pk 2500 $ 013 ea $32.69 pk 2500ct $ 01396 ea ‘534.90 pk ‘ZSOD/case $ .0188 ea ‘547.02 pk 2500ct  |No Bid No Bid

16 | Cups, Coffee, 8oz paper, wiids C$.035ea L C $35.60pk L C1000 cup$ 29ea $29.00 pk
19 25,000 $ .034ea $34.94 pk 11000 |$ .05887 ea $58.87 pk 1000 $ .05ea $50.90 pk 1000ct lid$ .018 ea $18.00 pk 1000/case 1000/case |$ .037 ea $37.68 pk 50/20ct |No Bid No Bid

17 Cups, Dessert, 90z Clear Plastic,
207 | wiDome Lid 25,000 No Bid $ .06535 ea $65.35 pk 1000 $ .07ea $70.45 pk 1000ct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

C C 1000 S .0518 ea $51.80 pk 1000/case cup 160z

18 |Cups, 3 Piece Grab N Go Kits LS .102ea L 1000 $ .0268 ea $26.80 pk 1000/case Lid Flat
21 10,000 I $102.14 pk_ |11000  |$ .09835 ea $98.35 pk 1000 $ .1137ea $113.75 pk 1000ct $ .0549 ea $54.90 pk 1000/case Insert4 0z |No Bid No Bid No Bid
22|19 |Gloves, Disposable 100,000 pair |$ .022 pr $22.42 pk 1000ct ¢ 0335 pr $16.75 pk 10/100 $ .02pr $18.99 pk 10/100ct  |$ .0167 pr $16.70 pk 10/100/case $.020 pr $20.76 pk 10/100  [$0.05pr  |$24.87 pk 1000 No Bid
23|20 |Gloves, Rubber 20 pair $1.38 pr $16.62 pk 12t $1.065 pr $6.39 pk 12 $ 12pr $5.88 pk 48ct $ 917 pr ‘5550 pk dozen $ .042 pr $6.12 pk 12 pair  |NoBid No Bid
24|21 |Napkins, Cocktail/Beverage (NAVY) |14 999 $ .021ea $21.15 pk 1000 f¢ 01798 ea $10.79 pk 12/50 $ .03ea $25.50 pk 4/250ct $ .0235ea ‘szs.so pk ‘1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid

21a Napkins, Cocktail/Beverage 1ply $.0029 ea $11.50 pk 4000
5| |(WHITE) 10,000 $.005 ea $22.78 pk 4000 2ply 01044 ea $31.32 pk 3000 $ .02ea $12.95 pk 4/250ct $ .00315 ea $12.60 pk 4000 $ .003 ea $14.08 pk 4000 No Bid No Bid
26|22 |Napkins, Dinner (NAVY) 10,000 $ .021ea $21.15 pk 1000 $ 04267 ea $25.60 pk 12/50 $ .0495 ea $49.50 pk 1000ct $ 04948 ea ‘$49.48 pk ‘moo No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 | 22| Napkins, Dinner (WHITE) 10,000 $ .010ea $31.83 pk 3000 $ .0092 ea $27.60 pk 20/150 $ 0129 ea $38.90 pk 3000ct $ 00866 ea $25.98 pk 3000 $ .0125 ea $37.35 pk 3000 No Bid No Bid
28|23 |Napkins, Disp. Mega Cartridge 2,000,000 |$ .006 ea $41.89 pk 6000 $ 0075 ea $39.45 pk 5250 $ .0081 ea $42.92 pk 5250ct $ 004875 ea $39.00 pk 8000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2924 |Paper, Deli Sheets 120,000 sheet]$ .009 sht $57.86 pk 6000 $ 0078 sht $46.98 pk 12/500 $ .0076 sht $45.63 pk 12/500ct $ .0075 sht $45.00 pk 6000 $ .0082 sht $49.42 pk 12/500 ct |No Bid No Bid

| 30125 Paper, Pan Liners

31 50,000 liner [$ .028 Inr $28.87 pk 1000 $ 0296 Inr $29.60 pk 1000 S 0305Inr  |$30.52 pk 1000ct $ .03Inr $30.00 pk 1000 $ 0349 Inr $34.88 pk 1000t |No Bid No Bid
32|26 |Plates, Foam & 10,000 $ .020ea $20.49 pk 1000 $ 0198 ea $19.80 pk 1000 $ 01156ea  $11.56 pk 1000ct No Bid $ 018 ea $18.80 pk 8/125ct | No Bid No Bid
33|27 |Plates, Foam 9" 50,000 $ 038ea $19.40 pk 500 $ .0372ea $18.60 pk 500 S O4ea $18.45 pk 500ct No Bid $ .035ea $17.70 pk 8/125¢t |No Bid No Bid
34|28 |Table covers, Round (NAVY) 480 $1.70 ea $20.49 pk 12 $1.68 ea $20.20 pk 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.89 ea $46.66 pk 12/cs No Bid

Purple Highlighted Items = Offer Rejected
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35 | 28a| Table Covers, Round (WHITE) 480 $1.70 ea $20.49 pk 122 $1.45 ea $36.25 pk 25 $2.15ea $53.65 pk 25ct $2.16 ea $54.00 pk 25/case No Bid $3.98ea  |$47.77 pk 12/cs  |NoBid
36|29 |Table covers 547x 108" (NAVY) | 4q4 $1.70 ea $20.49 pk 12 $1.66 ea $9.98 pk 6 $1.87 ea $46.85 pk 25ct $1.73ea $43.25 pk 25/case No Bid $2.05ea  |$49.12 pk 24/cs  |NoBid
37 |29a| Table covers 54" x 108" (WHITE) | 14, $1.09 ea $13.15 pk 12 $ .9987 ea $24.96 pk 25 $1.67 ea $41.65 pk 25ct $1.28ea $32.00 pk 25/case $1.208 ea $30.22 pk 25 ct $20lea  |$48.18 pk 24/cs  |NoBid
38|30 | Table Skirting, Plastic (NAVY) 240 $2.89 ea $34.60 pk 12 $3.98 ea $23.85 pk 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.93ea  |$47.19 pk 12/cs  |NoBid
39 |30a| Table Skirting, Plastic WHITE) | 49, $2.89 ea $34.69 pk 12 $3.98 ea $23.85 pk 6 $9.96 ea $119.55 pk 12ct $2.91ea $17.46 pk 6/case No Bid $4.09ea  |$49.12 pk 12/cs  |NoBid
4031 |Towels, Disposable (Zapper-type) |5 go5 $ 509 ea $22.92 pk 45 $ .072ea $14.45 pk 200 $ 022ea $32.65 pk 150ct $ 23ea $57.50 pk 250/case s 888 ea $39.98 pk 45ct No Bid No Bid
41|32 |Tray, Food, 1ib. 10,000 $ .021ea $21.39 pk 1000 $ .0177ea $17.70 pk 1000 $ 0168 ea $16.88 pk 1000ct $ 179ea $17.90 pk 1000/case $ 0189 ea $18.87 pk 4/250ct_ |No Bid No Bid

3 Tray, 60z Portion Tray, Plastic
2213 |BLack) 25,000 No Bid $ 0158 ea 31.75 pk 2000 $ 0114 ea $28.50 pk 2500ct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43|34 |Tray, 5-compart, Foam 3,250,000 |$ .045ea $22.94 pk 500 $ 033 ea $16.50 pk 500 $ .05ea $22.74 pk 4/125¢t $ 0338 ea $16.90 pk 500/case $ .038ea $19.32 pk 4/125 ¢t |No Bid No Bid
4435 |Tray. 3-compart, Foil wilid 20,000 $ .19 ea $38.85 pk 200 $ .18145ea $36.29 pk 200 $ 2lea $53.50 pk 250ct $ ldea $35.00 pk 250/case No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 Tray, Single-compart w/hinged
45 cover. Plastic 40,000 $ 124 ea $31.18 pk 250 $ 1248 ea $24.96 pk 200 $ 12ea $30.08 pk 250ct $ 119 ea $23.88 pk 200/case $ 1122 ea $28.05 pk 250 ct $0.021 ea $20.99 pk 1000 No Bid

37 |Utensil, Spork Kits . .
6 3,000,000 |$ .014ea $13.22 pk 1000 $ 01273 ea $12.73 pk 1000 $ 0143 ea $14.35 pk 1000ct $ 01266 ea $12.66 pk 1000/case $ 0l6ea $16.18 pk 1000ct  |NoBid No Bid
4738 |Utensil, Fork, IW 50,000 $ 0llea $10.59 pk 1000 $ 00975 ea $9.75 pk 1000 $ .0109 ea $10.94 pk 1000ct $ 00944 ea $9.94 pk 1000/case $ .0105 ea $10.53 pk 1000t |NoBid No Bid
48|39 |Utensil, Knife, IW 50,000 $ .0llea $10.59 pk 1000 $ 00975 ea $9.75 pk 1000 $ .0109 ea $10.94 pk 1000ct $ .00944 ea $9.94 pk 1000/case $ .0135ea $13.46 pk 1000ct  |No Bid No Bid
4940 |Utensil, Teaspoon, IW 50,000 $ 0llea $10.59 pk 1000 $ 00975 ea $9.75 pk 1000 $ .0109 ea $10.94 pk 1000ct $ 00994 ea $9.94 pk 1000/case $ .0105 ea $10.53 pk 1000t |No Bid No Bid
50|41 |Wrap. Foil, Heavy Duty 127 75 rolls $14.97 pk 500' $17.131l $17.13 pk 1RL $22.8511 $19.50 pk 1 $22.1010 $22.10 pk roll $18.821l $18.82 pk 1roll No Bid No Bid
51 |#1a| Wrap, Foil, Heavy Duty 18" 75 rolls $21.99 pk 500' $17.331l $17.33 pk 1RL $23.8511 $23.85 pk 1 $19.50 1l $19.50 pk roll $14.311l $14.31 pk 1roll No Bid No Bid
52|42 |Wrap, Poly 127 75 rolls $12.94 pk 20000 |$8.99+i $8.99 pk 1RL $9.15 11 $9.15 pk 1 $8.30 1l $8.30 pk roll $8.531 $8.53 PK 1roll No Bid No Bid
53 |42a| Wrap, Poly 187 75 rolls $19.92 pk 2000' $12.6511 $12.65 pk 1RL $12.49 1l $12.49 pk 1 $12.66 1l $12.66 pk roll $12.711l $12.71 pk 1 roll No Bid No Bid
54|43 |Wrap, Sandwich Wraps 15,000 $ .034ea $84.46 pk 2500 $ .0305 ea $76.35 pk 5/500 $ .0156 ea $31.98 pk 2000 ct No Bid $ .065 ea $163.86 pk 2500ct  |No Bid No Bid

Purple Highlighted Items = Offer Rejected



